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Critics typically regard Abe Kobo (1924-93) as writing against realism, due to his avant-garde aesthetics that
challenged the Naturalist realism dominating the literary mainstream and the Socialist realism of the
orthodox Left in postwar Japan. He considered his work thoroughly realist, however, and starting in the early
1950s in a series of avant-garde art and literary groups, he championed the possibility of a vital,
contemporary realism that challenged the reader to question the "reality" represented in the text through
increasingly self-conscious writing strategies. Through a reassessment of the texts in which he worked out
his theory of realism, this study traces the development of his commitment to making "truth from a lie"—to
fiction, drama, and reportage that openly display their artifice. Key argues that the reflexivity of Abe's texts,
which lay bare their own processes of artificial construction in order to reflect how our everyday sense of
reality is constructed and maintained, created a critical space for metatextual ideas that were not
acknowledged by the literary establishment of his time and have yet to be recognized by critics today.
Undergirding his theory and practice of realism was a critique of conventional documentary and of the
classic detective story. The texts examined here expose the degree to which the documentarian and the
detective are active fabricators of meaning rather than neutral observers of fact. By paying close attention to
the tension between the documentary and the fictive in Abe's works, Key draws out the ethical implications
of his documentary approach, arguing persuasively that the documentary qualities of his writing, such as its
valorization of objectivity over psychologism and the realm of "concrete things" over abstraction are
strategies for challenging the dominant assumptions about what constitutes good ethics and good art, as well
as the relationship between these two spheres.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Landers:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled Truth from a Lie: Documentary, Detection, and Reflexivity in Abe
Kobo's Realist Project (Studies of Modern Japan). Try to the actual book Truth from a Lie: Documentary,
Detection, and Reflexivity in Abe Kobo's Realist Project (Studies of Modern Japan) as your pal. It means
that it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter than ever.
Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know
everything by the book. So , we should make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

James Fletcher:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different
you can read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent the entire day to reading a reserve. The book Truth from a Lie: Documentary, Detection, and
Reflexivity in Abe Kobo's Realist Project (Studies of Modern Japan) it is rather good to read. There are a lot
of individuals who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. Should you did
not have enough space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this
book out of your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book features high quality.

Francisca Varney:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet.
Every year has been exactly added. This reserve Truth from a Lie: Documentary, Detection, and Reflexivity
in Abe Kobo's Realist Project (Studies of Modern Japan) was filled about science. Spend your extra time to
add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading a
book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern
era like currently, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Christine Furst:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's
soul or real their hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring in addition to can't
see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As



we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this Truth from a Lie: Documentary, Detection, and Reflexivity in Abe Kobo's
Realist Project (Studies of Modern Japan) can make you sense more interested to read.
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