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The urban crisis of the 1960s revived a dormant social activism whose protagonists placed their hoped for
radical change and political effectiveness in community action. Ironically, the insurgents chose the local
community as their terrain for a political battle that in reality involved a few strictly local issues. They failed
to achieve their goals, Ira Katznelson argues, not so much because they had chosen their ground badly but
because the deep split of the American political landscape into workplace politics and community politics
defeats attempts to address grievances or raise demands that break the rules of bread-and-butter unionism on
the one hand or of local politics on the other.
 
A fascinating record of the encounter between today’s reformers—the community activists—and the powers
they challenge. City Trenches is also a probing analysis of the causes of urban instability. Katznelson
anatomizes the unique workings of the American urban system which allow it to contain opposition through
“machine” politics and, as a last resort, institutional innovation and co-optation, for example, the authorities’
own version of decentralization used in the 1960s as a counter to a “community control.” Washington
Heights–Inwood, a multi-ethnic working-class community in northern Manhattan, provides the setting for an
absorbing close-up view of the historical evolution of local politics: the challenge to the system in the 1960s
and its reconstitution in the 1970s.
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From reader reviews:

Sharon Clayton:

The book City Trenches make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable much
more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem along
with your subject. If you can make reading a book City Trenches to be your habit, you can get considerably
more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You can
know everything if you like available and read a book City Trenches. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means
that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this guide?

Emilie Lechner:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This City Trenches book is readable by simply you who hate the straight
word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving also
decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer connected with City Trenches content
conveys the thought easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
content material but it just different such as it. So , do you still thinking City Trenches is not loveable to be
your top record reading book?

Richard Pascual:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading behavior give
you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of book
you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education books but if you want feel happy read one
using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the City Trenches is kind of publication
which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Helen Widner:

You can obtain this City Trenches by check out the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it might to
be your solve problem if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only
simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era similar to now,
you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your current
ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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