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Tracing the use of legal themes in the gothic novel, Bridget M. Marshall shows these devices reflect an
outpouring of anxiety about the nature of justice. On both sides of the Atlantic, novelists like William
Godwin, Mary Shelley, Charles Brockden Brown, and Hannah Crafts question the foundations of the Anglo-
American justice system through their portrayals of criminal and judicial procedures and their use of found
documents and legal forms as key plot devices. As gothic villains, from Walpole's Manfred to Godwin's
Tyrrell to Stoker's Dracula, manipulate the law and legal system to expand their power, readers are
confronted with a legal system that is not merely ineffective at stopping villains but actually enables them to
inflict ever greater harm on their victims. By invoking actual laws like the Black Act in England or the
Fugitive Slave Act in America, gothic novels connect the fantastic horrors that constitute their primary
appeal with much more shocking examples of terror and injustice. Finally, the gothic novel's preoccupation
with injustice is just one element of many that connects the genre to slave narratives and to the horrors of
American slavery.
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From reader reviews:

Ryan Wysocki:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take
a wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book called The
Transatlantic Gothic Novel and the Law, 1790-1860? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You realize
beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do
you agree with their opinion or you have different opinion?

Arturo McDaniel:

The particular book The Transatlantic Gothic Novel and the Law, 1790-1860 will bring someone to the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should you try to find
new book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The book The Transatlantic Gothic Novel and the Law, 1790-
1860 is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you
can more easily to read the book.

Michael Becker:

The book with title The Transatlantic Gothic Novel and the Law, 1790-1860 has lot of information that you
can understand it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This kind of book exist new
knowledge the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world today. That is
important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you within new
era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that
anywhere you want.

Marcos Hawkins:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This The Transatlantic Gothic Novel and the Law, 1790-1860 can
give you a lot of friends because by you considering this one book you have matter that they don't and make
you more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-
book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than additional make
you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Transatlantic Gothic Novel and the Law,
1790-1860.
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