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It’s 1974 in DeKalb County, Illinois and the planets have failed to align for Roy Conlon. Widowed and
broke, his eight-year-old son Eric is suddenly a mystery to him. The boy has become aware of a sky awhirl
with stars and of the universe outside his small-Midwestern town. And as powerful forces pull Eric away,
Roy’s efforts to hold onto his son are threatened by weakness, guilt, and his participation in a foolish crime.

 

Enter The Constellations, a novel of the diverging paths of a father and his son, and how each copes with the
loss of the woman whose love and guidance held them together. Roy and Eric’s parallel journeys take them
through a landscape populated by long shot players and kitchen sink philosophers, by ruthless thieves and
fierce protectors. A compelling novel of small town America in the shadow of Vietnam and Watergate,
Cunningham’s spare prose and deftly drawn heroes complete a portrait of our country reminiscent of Mark
Richard and Jim Shepard. Scarred, divided, and damaged, his characters represent all of our false promises
and failed dreams.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Barnett:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or the idea for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be obligated someone or something
that they don't desire do that. You must know how great along with important the book The Constellations
(Switchgrass). All type of book can you see on many methods. You can look for the internet sources or other
social media.

Larry Munoz:

The event that you get from The Constellations (Switchgrass) is a more deep you rooting the information that
hide inside words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
comprehend but The Constellations (Switchgrass) giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author
conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by simply anyone who read this because the
author of this book is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own vocabulary increase well.
Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose
you for having this specific The Constellations (Switchgrass) instantly.

Delilah Jordan:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. So you
know that little person like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important and also book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book.
Many kinds of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is niagra The Constellations
(Switchgrass).

Mark Guerrero:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half regions of the book. You can choose typically the book The Constellations
(Switchgrass) to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is developing when
you similar to reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the idea about
book and studying especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and examine it.
Beside that the reserve The Constellations (Switchgrass) can to be your brand new friend when you're truly
feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of the time.
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